HERKIMER COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT
LIQUID BITUMINOUS MATERIALS
BID DATE: FEBRUARY 5, 2025 - 10:00 A.M.

Vestal Asphalt, Inc

Suit-Kote Corporation

Peckham Road Corp

All States Construction Inc.

201 Stage Road 1911 Lorings Crossing Road 438 Vaughn Road 200 Church Street
Vestal, NY 13850 Cortland, NY 13045 Hudson Falls, NY 12839 Albany, NY 12202
607-785-3393 607-753-1100 518-462-5401
ITEM UNIT EST. QTY. | UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
702-3102 HFRS-2* GAL 325,000 $2.239 $727,675.00 $2.600 $845,000.00 $3.050 $991,250.00 $3.250 $1,056,250.00
*Note - Item 702-3102
to have demulsibility of
60 (ASTM)
702-3301 HFMS-2 GAL 20,000 $2.52 $50,300.00 $2.73 $54,600.00 $3.65 $73,000.00 $3.45 $69,000.00
Self-propelled Aggregate GAL 345,000 $0.075 $25,875.00 $0.100 $34,500.00 $0.300 $103,500.00 $0.250 $86,250.00
Spreader as per specification
with operator
Asphalt Price Adj. Fixed Price NEC. $100.00 $100.00 $100.00 $100.00
TOTAL BID $803,950.00 $934,200.00 $1,167,850.00 $1,211,600.00
OTHER BID PROPOSAL ITEMS UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
702-3301 HFMS-2 GAL $3.503 $2.730 $3.600 $3.200
702-3101 RS-2 GAL $3.308 $2.560 $3.050 $3.100
702-3201 MS-2 GAL $3.553 $2.850 $3.900 $3.100
702-3401 HFMS-2h GAL $3.707 $2.790 $4.100 $3.450
702-3801 HFRS-2P GAL $3.658 $2.760 $3.350 $3.750
Polymer-Modified Rapid Set
702-3501 SS-1 GAL $2.239 $2.690 $3.250 $3.100
Bituminous Paver per Per Day (10 hours) $4,000.00 $3,400.00 $8,800.00 $4,500.000
specifications, w/operators Per Day (8 hours) $3,700.00 $3,300.00 $7,400.00 $4,000.000
Grinding machine as per Per Day (10 hours) $6,650.00 $6,400.00 No Bid $9,000.000
specifications, w/operators Per Day (8 hours) $6,350.00 $6,300.00 No Bid $8,500.000
Recycling Machine Per Day (10 hours) No Bid $6,100.00 No Bid $9,000.000
Depth of Cut - 2" to 9" Per Day (8 hours) No Bid $5,900.00 No Bid $8,500.000
Depth of Cut - Greater than Per Day (10 hours) No Bid $6,400.00 No Bid $9,500.000
9" to 14" Per Day (8 hours) No Bid $6,200.00 No Bid $9,000.000
Pug Mill Per Day (10 hours) $3,000.00 $2,200.00 $5,000.00 $3,000.000
Per Day (8 hours) $2,800.00 $2,000.00 $4,400.00 $2,750.000
Double Drum Steel Roller Per Day (10 hours) $2,600.00 $2,200.00 $3,800.00 $2,750.000
Per Day (8 hours) $2,400.00 $2,100.00 $3,300.00 $2,500.000
Pneumatic Tire Roller Per Day (10 hours) $2,500.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,750.000
Per Day (8 hours) $2,300.00 $1,900.00 $3,500.00 $2,500.000
Production Cold Micro Milling SQUARE YARDS No Bid $0.980 No Bid $1.950
Machine, w/Operator
Sheep Foot Roller w/Operator Per Day (10 hours) $3,000.00 $3,100.00 No Bid $3,400.000
(min wt. of 25,000 Ibs) Per Day (8 hours) $2,800.00 $3,050.00 No Bid $3,000.000

| certify that the abor/}t;bula on represents the canvas of bids.

F:
[/\/

I/

County Highwy Superintendent

Mark A. Nagele/P £. .\(

2,1/%/25




