REFLECTIVE SIGN MATERIALS
BID TABULATION - DETAILED

February 4, 2026
_ Sheet 1 of 9
Ennis-Flint Inc. Newman Signs, Inc.
GROUP 1 4161 Piedmont Pkwy, Ste 370 1606 6th Ave SW
Greensboro, NC 27410 Jamestown, ND 58401
ltem |Size | Qnty. Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Roll Goods - ASTM Type XI (except for black)
Red 8"x50yds 1 $0.00 $177.63 $177.63 $0.00
Blue 6"x50yds 1 $0.00 $177.63 $177.63 $0.00
Green 12"x50yds 1 $0.00 $354.00 $354.00 $0.00
Brown 12"x50yds 1 $0.00 $354.00 $354.00 $0.00
Red 18"x50yds 1 $0.00 $532.89 $532.89 $0.00
Yellow 30"x50yds 1 $0.00 $885.00 $885.00 $0.00
White 30"x50yds 1 $0.00 $885.00 $885.00 $0.00
Yellow 36"x50yds 1 $0.00 $1,062.00 $1,062.00 $0.00
Black Non Reflective 24"x50yds 1 $0.00 $265.26 $265.26 $0.00
Sub Group Total $0.00 $4,693.41 $0.00
Roll Goods - (FLUORESCENT) ASTM Type XI
Orange 36"x50yds 1 $0.00 $1,561.50 $1,561.50 $0.00
Yellow-Green 6"x50yds 1 $0.00 $185.52 $185.52 $0.00
Sub Group Total $0.00 $1,747.02 $0.00
Vehicle Marking Tape
680 CR - 85 Black 3/4"x50yds 2 $0.00 $44.82 $89.64 $0.00
580 CR - 85 Black 1"x50yds 2 $0.00 $60.66 $121.32 $0.00
680 CR - 85 Black 2"x50yds 2 $0.00 $121.32 $242.64 $0.00
Red/White Conspicuity #983-326 6"/6" | 2"x50yds 1 $0.00 $76.31 $76.31 $0.00
Sub Group Total $0.00 $529.91 $0.00
TOTAL GROUP 1 $0.00 $6,970.34 $0.00




REFLECTIVE SIGN MATERIALS
BID TABULATION - DETAILED

February 4, 2026

_ Sheet 2 of 9
Ennis-Flint Inc. Newman Signs, Inc. Newman Signs, Inc.
GROUP 2 4161 Piedmont Pkwy, Ste 370 1606 6th Ave SW CORRECTED
Greensboro, NC 27410 Jamestown, ND 58401
ltem |Size | Qnty. | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Parking Series ASTM Type XI
Various Legends | 12x18" | 60 $0.00 $8.35 $501.00 $8.35 $501.00
Sub Group Total $0.00 $501.00 $501.00
Regulatory Series ASTM Type XI
Various Legends 24"x8" 5 $0.00 $13.11 $65.55 $13.11 $65.55
Various Legends 24"x30" 50 $0.00 $16.97 $848.50 $16.97 $848.50
Various Legends 60"x30" 5 $0.00 $31.10 $155.50 $31.10 $155.50
Various Legends 48"x30" 10 $0.00 $25.87 $258.70 $25.87 $258.70
STOP 30" Oct. 20 $0.00 $18.00 $360.00 $18.00 $360.00
STOP 36" Oct. 20 $0.00 $23.81 $476.20 $23.81 $476.20
YIELD 36" 5 $0.00 $14.24 $71.20 $14.24 $71.20
Sub Group Total $0.00 $2,235.15 $2,235.65
Warning Series ASTM Type XI
Various Legends 30"x30" 200 $0.00 $20.05 $4,010.00 $20.05 $4,010.00
Various Legends 48"x24" 10 $0.00 $24.24 $242.40 $24.24 $242.40
Various Legends 36"x18" 30 $0.00 $15.72 $471.60 $15.72 $471.60
__ MPH 24"x24" 20 $0.00 $14.55 $291.00 $14.55 $291.00
Various Legends 36"x36" 10 $0.00 $26.75 $267.50 $26.75 $267.50
__ MPH 18"x18" 30 $0.00 $10.27 $308.10 $10.27 $308.10
Various Legends 24"x18" 10 $0.00 $12.08 $120.80 $12.08 $120.80
Various Legends 24"x8" 10 $0.00 $10.33 $103.30 $10.33 $103.30
Object Marker-Left & Right 12"x36" 10 $0.00 $12.06 $241.20 $12.06 $120.60
Various Legends 24"x30" 10 $0.00 $16.97 $169.70 $16.97 $169.70
Various Legends 30"x36" 10 $0.00 $20.62 $206.20 $20.62 $206.20
Sub Group Total $0.00 $6,431.80 $6,311.20
SPECIAL SIGNS ASTM Type XI
$500 Fine Littering or Dumping Strictly
Prohibited All Roads Herkimer Coutny
Red/black/white 30"x36" 10 $0.00 $27.16 $271.60 $27.16 $271.60
No Dumping Red/white 12"x18" 10 $0.00 $8.40 $84.00 $8.40 $84.00
No Jumping or Diving From Bridge
Yellow/Brown 18"x24" 5 $0.00 $17.19 $85.95 $17.19 $85.95
Sub Group Total $0.00 $441.50 $441.55
Fluorescent Orange Warning Series ASTM Type XI
Various Legends 30"x30" 10 $0.00 $20.39 $203.90 $20.39 $203.90
orange/black border 24"x24" 10 $0.00 $14.77 $147.70 $14.77 $147.70
Various Legends 36"x36" 20 $0.00 $27.25 $545.00 $27.25 $545.00
Various Legends 48"x24" 10 $0.00 $25.10 $251.00 $25.10 $251.00
Various Legends 48"x36" 10 $0.00 $30.10 $301.00 $30.10| $301.00
Sub Group Totall $0.00 $1,448.60 $1,448.60




REFLECTIVE SIGN MATERIALS
BID TABULATION - DETAILED
February 4, 2026

Sheet 3 of 9
Ennis-Flint Inc. Newman Signs, Inc. Newman Signs, Inc.
GROUP 2 - Continued 4161 Piedmont Pkwy, Ste 370 1606 6th Ave SW CORRECTED
Greensboro, NC 27410 Jamestown, ND 58401
Fluorescent Orange Guide Series ASTM Type XI
Next __ Mile 24"x18" 10 $0.00 $12.25 $245.00 $12.25 $122.50
Next __ Miles 24"x18" 10 $0.00 $12.25 $245.00 $12.25 $122.50
Detour Left & Right 48"x18" 10 $0.00 $19.67 $196.70 $19.67 $196.70
End Road Work 36"x24" 10 $0.00 $17.44 $174.40 $17.44 $174.40
End Detour 30"x24" 10 $0.00 $17.24 $172.40 $17.24 $172.40
Road Work Next __ Miles 60"x24" 5 $0.00 $35.16 $175.80 $35.16 $175.80
Sub Group Total $0.00 $1,209.30 $964.30
Fluorescent Yellow-Green ASTM Type XI

Various Legends 24"x8" 10 $0.00 $9.87 $98.70 $9.87 $98.70
Various Legends 24"x12" 10 $0.00 $8.95 $89.50 $8.95 $89.50
Various Legends 24"x24" 10 $0.00 $13.24 $132.40 $13.24 $132.40
Various Legends 30"x18" 10 $0.00 $14.32 $143.20 $14.32 $143.20
Various Legends 30"x30" 20 $0.00 $20.73 $414.60 $20.73 $414.60
Various Legends 36"x36" 10 $0.00 $27.74 $277.40 $27.74 $277.40
School Bus Stop Ahead (Symbol) 36"x36" 20 $0.00 $31.00 $620.00 $31.00 $620.00
Sub Group Total $0.00 $1,775.80 $1,775.80

TOTAL GROUP 2| $0.00 $14,043.15 $13,678.10




REFLECTIVE SIGN MATERIALS
BID TABULATION - DETAILED
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Ennis-Flint Inc. Newman Signs, Inc.
GROUP 3 4161 Piedmont Pkwy, Ste 370 1606 6th Ave SW
Greensboro, NC 27410 Jamestown, ND 58401
ltem ISize | Qnty.
Street Name Series (ASTM Type XI)

Green/White Legend 24"x12" 2 $0.00 $13.17 $26.34 $0.00
Green/White Legend 30"x12" 2 $0.00 $15.74 $31.48 $0.00
Green/White Legend 36"x12" 2 $0.00 $17.61 $35.22 $0.00
Green/White Legend 42"x12" 2 $0.00 $19.49 $38.98 $0.00
Green/White Legend 48"x12" 2 $0.00 $21.36 $42.72 $0.00
Green/White Legend 54"x12" 2 $0.00 $23.25 $46.50 $0.00
Green/White Legend 60"x12" 2 $0.00 $25.12 $50.24 $0.00
Green/White Legend 66"x12" 2 $0.00 $27.02 $54.04 $0.00
Brown/Yellow Legend 24"x12" 2 $0.00 $13.86 $27.72 $0.00
Brown/Yellow Legend 30"x12" 2 $0.00 $15.74 $31.48 $0.00
Brown/Yellow Legend 36"x12" 2 $0.00 $17.61 $35.22 $0.00
Brown/Yellow Legend 42"x12" 2 $0.00 $19.49 $38.98 $0.00
Brown/Yellow Legend 48"x12" 2 $0.00 $21.36 $42.72 $0.00
Brown/Yellow Legend 54"x12" 2 $0.00 $23.25 $46.50 $0.00
Brown/Yellow Legend 60"x12" 2 $0.00 $25.25 $50.50 $0.00
Sub Group Total $0.00 $598.64 $0.00

TOTAL GROUP 3| $0.00 $598.64 $0.00




REFLECTIVE SIGN MATERIALS
BID TABULATION - DETAILED
February 4, 2026
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Ennis-Flint Inc. Newman Signs, Inc.
GROUP 4 4161 Piedmont Pkwy, Ste 370 1606 6th Ave SW
Greensboro, NC 27410 Jamestown, ND 58401
ltem |Size | Qnty.
Prismatic ASTM Type XI
Barricade Sheeting-left/right | s'xs0yds | 1 $0.00 $180.00 $180.00 $0.00
Sub Group Total $0.00 $180.00
TOTAL GROUP 4] $0.00 $180.00 $0.00
Ennis-Flint Inc. Newman Signs, Inc.
GROUP 5 4161 Piedmont Pkwy, Ste 370 1606 6th Ave SW
Greensboro, NC 27410 Jamestown, ND 58401
ltem ISize | Qnty.
Letters & Numbers - 25/Pk w/Application Tape

Series C-Black 2" 5 $0.00 $10.25 $51.25 $0.00
Series C-Yellow 2" 5 $0.00 $10.25 $51.25 $0.00
Series C-White 2" 5 $0.00 $10.25 $51.25 $0.00
Series C-Black 3" 5 $0.00 $11.17 $55.85 $0.00
Series C-White 3" 5 $0.00 $11.17 $55.85 $0.00
Series C-Yellow 3" 5 $0.00 $11.17 $55.85 $0.00
Series D-Black 4" 5 $0.00 $13.00 $65.00 $0.00
Series D-White 4" 5 $0.00 $13.00 $65.00 $0.00
Series D-Black 5" 5 $0.00 $15.47 $77.35 $0.00
Series D-Black 6" 5 $0.00 $16.69 $83.45 $0.00
Series D-White 6" 5 $0.00 $16.69 $83.45 $0.00
Series D-Yellow 6" 5 $0.00 $16.69 $83.45 $0.00
Series E-Black 8" 5 $0.00 $25.84 $129.20 $0.00
Series E-Black 10" 5 $0.00 $34.95 $174.75 $0.00
Sub Group Total $0.00 $1,082.95 $0.00

TOTAL GROUP 5 $0.00 $1,082.95 $0.00




REFLECTIVE SIGN MATERIALS
BID TABULATION - DETAILED
February 4, 2026
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Ennis-Flint Inc. Newman Signs, Inc. Newman Signs, Inc.
GROUP 6 4161 Piedmont Pkwy, Ste 370 1606 6th Ave SW CORRECTED
Greensboro, NC 27410 Jamestown, ND 58401
Item [Size | Qnty.
Unique Dating Stickers - 100/Pk ASTM Type |
White/Black | 22545 [ 5 $0.00 $24.00 $120.00 $24.00 $120.00
Sub Group Total $0.00 $120.00 $120.00
County Vehicle Emblems ASTM Type |
Gold/Blue 10" Dia. 20 $0.00 $6.52 $130.40 $6.52 $130.40
\White/Black 9" Dia. 20 $0.00 $6.23 $124.60 $6.23 $124.60
White/Black 12" Dia. 20 $0.00 $6.48 $129.60 $6.48 $129.60
: Small
Whits/Bigek Diamond 20 $0.00 $6.62 $132.40 $6.62 $132.40
. Large
WhiteiBlack Diamond e $0.00 $7.48 $149.60 $7.48 $149.60
Sub Group Total $0.00 $666.60 $666.60
TOTAL GROUP 6| $0.00 $666.60 $786.60
Ennis-Flint Inc. Newman Signs, Inc. Ennis-Flint
GROUP 7 4161 Piedmont Pkwy, Ste 370 1606 6th Ave SW Notes
Greensboro, NC 27410 Jamestown, ND 58401
Item [Size | Qnty.
Preformed Thermoplastic Pav t Markings
Stop Line 12"-125mil [ 900’ $2.20 $1,980.00 $0.00 $0.00 30'/box
. ) 12"x18"
Yield Line Triangle 125 mil = $5.32 $63.84 $0.00 $0.00
R 24"x36"
il Line Thangle 125 mil i $10.00 $120.00 $0.00 $0.00
T 6'-6"x20'
R Kit Narow 125 mil 2 $207.00 $414.00 $0.00 $0.00
"STOP" 8' - 125 mil 4 $110.00 $440.00 $0.00 $0.00
"AHEAD" 8' - 125 mil $150.00 $300.00 $0.00 $0.00
"ONLY" 8' - 125 mil 2 $110.00 $220.00 $0.00 $0.00
Bicycle Rider w/ Helmet 4'x2' - 90mil 10 $46.00 $460.00 $0.00 $0.00 5/box
8'x6'"-4"
st Tan. Arrow 125 mil b $68.50 $205.50 $0.00 $0.00 2/box
) 8'x6'-4"
FRight FOm AW 125 mil # $68.50 $205.50 $0.00 $0.00 2/box
Sub Group Total $4,408.84 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL GROUP 7 $4,408.84 $0.00 $0.00




REFLECTIVE SIGN MATERIALS
BID TABULATION - DETAILED

February 4, 2026
Sheet 7 of 9
Ennis-Flint Inc. Newman Signs, Inc. Newman Signs, Inc.
GROUP 8 4161 Piedmont Pkwy, Ste 370 1606 6th Ave SW CORRECTED
Greensboro, NC 27410 Jamestown, ND 58401
Item |Size | Qnty.
Aluminum Sign Blanks
4" X 8" 100 $0.00 $3.36 $336.00 $3.36 $336.00
8" X 12" 100 $0.00 $4.32 $432.00 $4.32 $432.00
18" X 18" 50 $0.00 $10.34 $517.00 $10.34 $517.00
24" X 8" 20 $0.00 $7.18 $143.60 $7.18 $143.60
24" X 18" 20 $0.00 $12.93 $258.60 $12.93 $258.60
24" X 24" 50 $0.00 $16.37 $818.50 $16.37 $818.50
30" X 6" 20 $0.00 $6.90 $138.00 $6.90 $138.00
30" X 18" 20 $0.00 $15.51 $310.20 $15.51 $310.20
30" X 36" 20 $0.00 $28.42 $568.40 $28.42 $568.40
80" (School) | 10 $0.00 $24.12 $241.20 $24.12 $241.20
30" X 24" 20 $0.00 $19.82 $396.40 $19.82 $396.40
30" X 30" 50 $0.00 $24.12 $1,206.00 $24.12 $1,206.00
36"X18" 20 $0.00 $18.10 $362.00 $18.10 $362.00
36" X 24" 20 $0.00 $23.25 $465.00 $23.25 $465.00
36" X 36" 25 $0.00 $33.58 $839.50 $33.58 $839.50
36" (School)) 10 $0.00 $34.36 $343.60 $34.36 $343.60
36" 10

(Triangle) $0.00 $18.95 $189.50 $18.95 $189.50
36" x 12" 20 $0.00 $12.93 $258.60 $12.93 $258.60
48"x 18" 5 $0.00 $23.04 $115.20 $23.04 $115.20
48" x 24" 5 $0.00 $29.85 $149.25 $29.85 $149.25
48" x 30" 5 $0.00 $36.66 $183.30 $36.66 $183.30
60" x 24" 5 $0.00 $41.14 $205.70 $41.14 $205.70
60" x 30" 5 $0.00 $49.65 $248.25 $49.65 $248.25
72" x 3" 25 $0.00 $7.76 $194.00 $7.76 $194.00
10" x 30" 6 $0.00 $9.77 $58.62 $9.77 $58.62
10" x 36" 6 $0.00 $11.21 $67.26 $11.21 $67.26
10" x 42" 6 $0.00 $12.64 $75.84 $12.64 $75.84
10" x 48" 6 $0.00 $13.95 $83.70 $13.95 $83.70
10" x 54" 6 $0.00 $17.30 $103.80 $17.30 $103.80
10" x 60" 6 $0.00 $21.26 $127.56 $21.26 $127.56
10" x 66" 6 $0.00 $17.47 $104.82 $17.47 $104.82
12' x 30" 10 $0.00 $11.21 $112.10 $11.21 $112.10
12" x 36" 10 $0.00 $12.93 $129.30 $12.93 $129.30
12" x 42" 10 $0.00 $14.65 $146.50 $14.65 $146.50
12" x 48" 10 $0.00 $16.22 $162.20 $16.22! $162.20
12" x 54" 10 $0.00 $19.85 $198.50 $19.85] $198.50
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Ennis-Flint Inc. Newman Signs, Inc. Newman Signs, Inc.
GROUP 8 - Continued 4161 Piedmont Pkwy, Ste 370 1606 6th Ave SW CORRECTED
Greensboro, NC 27410 Jamestown, ND 58401
ltem [Size | Qnty.
Aluminum Sign Blanks
12" x 60" 10 $0.00 $24.12 $241.20 $24.12 $241.20
12" x 66" 10 $0.00 $25.82 $258.20 $25.82 $258.20
12" x 72" 10 $0.00 $27.51 $275.10 $27.51 $275.10
ap" 10
(octagon) $0.00 $19.10 $191.00 $19.10 $191.00
36"
(octagon) b $0.00 $34.28 $342.80 $34.28 $342.80
48"
(ocatgon) 10 $0.00 $59.99 $599.00 $59.99 $599.90
Price per
square inch 1
for additional
unlisted size
$0.00 $0.24 $0.00 $0.24 $0.24
Sub Group Total $0.00 | $12,116.42 $12,198.44
TOTAL GROUP 8 $0.00 f $12,116.42 $12,198.44




REFLECTIVE SIGN MATERIALS
BID TABULATION - SUMMARY
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Ennis-Flint Inc. Newman Signs, Inc. Newman Signs, Inc.
Group Bid Summary 4161 Piedmont Pkwy, Ste 370 1606 6th Ave SW CORRECTED
Greensboro, NC 27410 Jamestown, ND 58401

GROUP 1 NO Bid $6,970.34 -

GROUP 2 No Bid $14,043.15 $13,678.10
GROUP 3 No Bid $598.64 -

GROUP 4 NO Bid $180.00 -

GROUP 5 NO Bid $1,082.95 -

GROUP 6 NO Bid $666.60 $786.60
GROUP 7 $4,408.84 No Bid -

GROUP 8 NO Bid $12,116.42 $12,198.44

| certify that this tabulation is a true and corr

elﬁwpy of the canvas of bids.

MARKA NAGE E,PE.

County Supermtenden of Highways

Designates Error
Designates Low Bid
Designates Rejected Bid
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